CITY OF KYLE

VENDOR: 05433 - YWONME FLORES-CALE

DATE
11/3f2022

INVOQICE #
11.03.22YFC

POH

Y

DESCRIFTION
Relm. for candy at Halloween avent

628584
11/08/2022 628584
GLACCT # AMOUNT
1100-10002-521410 50.72

50.72




REQUEST FOR EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT FORM
FOR CITY-RELATED MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS EXPENSE
INCURRED BY MEMBERS OF CITY COUNCIL

Yvonne Flores-Cale

Name of Council Member:

Date of Expense |  Description of City-Related Business Expense Total Cost
110/22/2022 | Candy for City Halloween event $14.74
110/21/2022 !Candy for City Halloween event $-38:95|=2= 8\_

(Lofo tae)
Total Expense Reimbursement Request: $-53.69

***Please ensure that all receipts for items listed above are attached to this fnﬂn""fg., 32,

| hereby certify that the expense(s) listed above are accurately recorded and represent
only expenditures made by me for City-related business purposes.

y sagnetd oy Yeorme Cais

i . Lt L
Lhernastana, Yan Do 302214 1) (%35

Signature:

ome. | 11/03/2022

Updated: 9/20/2022
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Re: Reimbursement Request

Yvette Aleman <yaleman@cityofkyle.com>
Fri 11/4/2022 7:20 AM
To: Jennifer Holm <Jholm@cityofkyle.com>

Cc: Andy Alejandro <talejandro@cityofkyle.com>;Perwez Maheet <pmoheet@cityofkyle.com> Accounts
Payable <accountspayable@cityofkyle.com>

Thank you, | will process the reimbursement.

Yvette Alemarv

Staff Accountant

City of Kyle

100 W. Center Street

Kyle, TX TBG40

Direct Line (512) 262-3972
Fax (512) 262-3987

#TeamKyle Core Values: Knowledge, Yes-Atfitude, and Employees Accountability

From: Jennifer Holm <Jholm@cityofkyle.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 1:439 PM

To: Yvette Aleman <yaleman@cityofkyle.com>

Cc: Andy Alejandro <talejandro@cityofkyle.com>; Perwez Moheet <pmoheet@cityofkyle.com>
Subject: Fw: Reimbursement Request

Please see attached Reimbursement Reguest from Councll Member Flares-Cale. Please process
using 1100-10000-521410 unless there's a more appropriate line item

TJenwnifer Holmy, TRMC

City Secretary
Assistant to the City Manager
City of Kyle

Pie Capital of Texas®

jholm@cilyofkyie com
{0) 512.262.3981

#TeamKyle Core Values: Knowledge, Yes-Attitude, and Employee Accountability

From: Yvorne Flores-Cale <YCale @cityofkyle.com>
sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 10:18 AM

To: lennifer Holm <lholm@cityofkyle.com>
Subject: Re: Reimbursement Reguest

lennifer,




Good morning and please see attached @
Thank you for all your help, hopefully | have it all down and | won't be such a mess next time.
Have a great day,

Yvonne Flores-Cale
City of Kyle, City Council
District 2 Representative

From: Jennifer Holm <lhalm@cityofkyle.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 9:21 AM

To: Yvonne Flores-Cale <YCale@cityofkyle.com=
Cc: Jerry Hendrix <[hendrix@cityofkyle.com>
Subject: Reimbursement Request

Ms, Flores-Cale,
ds discussed, | sent in your receipts to Finance to find out about the reimburseément. There is a reguired

fillable reimbursement request form located on the City's website

at: https://www.cityofkyle.com/cityadministration/expense-forms-council

Expense Forms for Council

www.cityofloyle com

| have attached your scanned receipts to this email to assist you. Please let me know if you
need anything further. When you fill out the form, you can submit it to me, I'll code it and submit to
finance for payment

Jenwnifer Holmy, TRMC

City Secretary

Assistant to the City Manager
City of Kyle

Pie Capital of Texas®

inplm@cityolkyle com
(o) 512.262.3981

#TeamKyle Core Values: Knowledge, Yes-Atlitude, and Employee Accountability




